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Reference:   FOI.10744.23 

Subject:    GP surgeries and NHS dentists 

Date of Request: 23 January 2023 

 

Requested: 
 
1. A list of all GP surgeries in Pembrokeshire 
 
2. Please indicate which surgeries are managed, partnerships and single doctor practices 
 
3. The total number of patients registered at each practice  
 
4. The number of doctors at each surgery split between full time and part time 

 

5. The total weekly hours worked (if contracted to work) by doctors at each surgery 
 

6. When was the last patient participation group meeting held at each practice 
 

7. A list of all dental surgeries in Pembrokeshire where NHS work is currently carried out 
 

8. The number of Health Board employed dentists and where located 
 

9. The number of NHS dentists at each dental surgery where NHS work is carried out split between 
full and part time work 

 

10. Total weekly hours worked by NHS dentists at each surgery 
 

11. Total Health Board funds allocated to NHS dental surgeries in Pembrokeshire 
 

12. Projected provisional recovery of funds where contract delivery measures are unable to achieve 
improved access for NHS patients 

 

Response: 
 
1. - 6. Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) provides the information requested, within the 

table below. 
 

   Full time Doctors Part time 
Doctors 

 

GP Practice Type Number 
of 
patients 

Number Total 
weekly 
hours 

Number Total 
weekly 
hours 

Meeting 
date 

Argyle Medical 
Group Partnership 22,672 1 37.5 7 210.5 

November 
2022 

Narberth 
Surgery Partnership 8,962 0 0 7 195.04 

No 
meeting 

Saundersfoot 
Surgery Partnership 9,904 4 150 2 60.25 

No 
meeting 

Tenby Surgery Managed 7,218 0 0 2 36 
No 
meeting 



Page 2 of 3 
 

Neyland & 
Johnston 
Surgery Managed 5,887 3 112.5 0 0 

No 
meeting 

Barlow House 
Surgery Partnership 9,076 0 0 8 191.68 

No 
meeting 

Robert Street 
Surgery Partnership 8,188 0 0 7 164.61 

No 
meeting 

Winch Lane 
Surgery Partnership 15,081 7 280 3 60 

November 
2022 

St Thomas 
Surgery Partnership 13,058 5 203.5 3 70 

No 
meeting 

Solva Surgery 
Single 
handed  2,442 1 40 0 0 

No 
meeting 

St Davids 
Surgery Partnership 2,575 0 0 3 66.67 

No 
meeting 

Fishguard 
Surgery Partnership 9,574 2 75 5 132 

No 
meeting 

Newport and 
Crymch Partnership 7,925 2 75 3 75 

No 
meeting 

 
Please note:- The contract for Solva Surgery is to be handed back 31 March 2023. 
 
 
7. The UHB provides, within the table below, the dental surgeries in Pembrokeshire, where NHS 

work is currently undertaken 
 

Bridge Street Dental Practice, Haverfordwest 

Brynteg Dental Practice, Tenby 

Charles Street Dental Practice, Miford Haven 

Dental Excellence, Pembroke 

Dew Street Dental Practice, Haverfordwest 

My Dentist, Robert Street, Milford Haven 

Haven Dental Practice, Milford Haven 

My Smile Centre, Milford Haven 

Pembroke Dock Dental Care, Pembroke Dock 

Portfield Dental Surgery, Haverfordwest 

My Dentist, Quay Street, Haverfordwest 

St Davids Dental Practice, St Davids 

Vergam Dental Practice, Fishguard 

West Street Dental Practice, Fishguard 

Winchester House Dental Practice, Narberth 

 
8. The UHB confirms that its Community Dental Service employs 11 dentists, with a whole time 

equivalent (WTE) of 8.4. As some of the dentists work across multiple sites, the UHB provides, 
within the table below, the information broken down by surgery and WTE.  

 

Dental surgery WTE 

Elizabeth Williams Clinic, Llanelli 2.6 

Pond Street, Carmarthen 0.8 
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Urgent Access Service 1.2 

North Road Clinic, Aberystywth 0.6 

Cardigan Integrated Care Centre 0.6 

Withybush General Hospital, Haverfordwest 0.6 

Winch Lane Health Centre, Haverfordwest 1.4 

Tenby Cottage Hospital 0.6 

 
9. & 10. The UHB does not hold the information regarding individual dentists’ working hours, as 

the individual dentists are employed by the contract holder and not the UHB. 
 
However, whilst operating in accordance with the Section 45 Freedom of Information Code of 
Practice, the UHB has a duty to provide advice and assistance. Therefore, the UHB provides, 
within the table overleaf, the number of dentists at each Dental Practice as per the NHS contract. 

 

Dental Practice Number of dentists 

Bridge Street Dental Practice 2 

Brynteg Dental Practice 3 

Charles Street Dental Practice 3 

Dental Excellence 2 

Dew Street Dental Practice 4 

My Dentist, Robert Street 2 

Haven Dental Practice 5 

My Smile Centre 4 

Pembroke Dock Dental Care 1 

Portfield Dental Surgery 2 

My Dentist, Quay Street 4 

St Davids Dental Practice 3 

Vergam Dental Practice 2 

West Street Dental Practice 1 

Winchester House Dental Practice 2 

 
11. The UHB confirms that the total funds for General Dental Services allocated to NHS dental 

surgeries in Pembrokeshire is £4,603,782.14, during the 2022/23 financial year. 
 
12. The UHB does not hold this information, as it does not have the full twelve (12) months’ data 

set. 
 
 

 


